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Preservation, Restoration, Education and Recreation

DATE: February 5, 2015
MEMO TO: S. Michael Rummel, Chair
Finance and Administrative Committee
FROM: Steve Neaman, Director of Finance
SUBJECT:  Annual Purchase of Chemicals and Fertilizers for Golf Courses

RECOMMENDATION: Recommend approval of a Resolution Awarding Contracts for Chemicals and

Fertilizer for use at District Golf Courses.

BACKGROUND: These products are purchased annually to maintain the golf course grounds at all District

golf courses. Bids were advertised in December 2014. Ten bids were received. Each highlighted bid listed on
Exhibit A to the attached Resolution is the lowest responsible bid for the corresponding type of product listed.

REASON FOR RECOMMENDATION: Committee recommendation and Board approval are required in

accordance with District Purchasing Policy.

REVIEW BY OTHERS: Director of Operations and Public Safety, Purchasing Manager, Golf

Superintendent, Legal Counsel.

FINANCIAL DATA: This expenditure was approved as part of the adopted FY 2014/15 Budget as follows:

Countryside Brae Loch ThunderHawk Total
Accounts 80523800 81523800 83523800

Herbicides 642200 $7,000 $1,500 $4,000 $12,500
Fertilizer 642300 $40,000 $13,500 $36,000 $89,500
Protectors 642400 $30,000 $5,500 $85,000 | $120,500
Insecticides 642500 $7,000 $0 $8,000 $15,000
Chemicals 642600 $20,000 $3,500 $40,000 $63,500

$104,000 $24,000 $173,000 $301,000

PRESENTER: Steve Neaman



STATE OF ILLINOIS)
) SS
COUNTY OF LAKE )

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
LAKE COUNTY FOREST PRESERVE DISTRICT
REGULAR FEBRUARY MEETING
FEBRUARY 10, 2015
MADAM PRESIDENT AND MEMBERS OF THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS:

Your FINANCE AND ADMINISTRATIVE COMMITTEE presents herewith “A Resolution
Awarding Contracts for Chemicals and Fertilizers for District Golf Courses” and requests its adoption.

FINANCE AND ADMINISTRATIVE COMMITTEE

Yea Nay

O 0O
S. Michael Rummel, Chair

O 0O
Linda Pedersen, Vice-Chair

O O
Steve Carlson

O O
Bill Durkin

O O
Sandra Hart

O O
Aaron Lawlor

O O

Audrey Nixon



LAKE COUNTY FOREST PRESERVE DISTRICT
LAKE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

A RESOLUTION AWARDING CONTRACTS FOR CHEMICALS AND FERTILIZERS
FOR DISTRICT GOLF COURSES

WHEREAS, the Lake County Forest Preserve District (the “District””) has advertised in The News Sun
for sealed bids to purchase chemicals and fertilizers, which are listed as the "ltems" on the attached
exhibit (the “Products”); and

WHEREAS, in the past, the District has expended more than $20,000.00 annually to purchase the
Products; and

WHEREAS, it is efficient and in the District’s best interest to solicit bids and approve contracts with the
lowest responsible bidders for the purchase of the Products that will be needed over the course of the
fiscal year; and

WHEREAS, all sealed bids were received and opened by the District at its General Offices, 1899 West
Winchester Road, Libertyville, 1llinois on January 5, 2015 at 10:00 a.m. and such bids are summarized on
the exhibit attached hereto (the "Exhibit™); and

WHEREAS, the District’s staff, the Purchasing Manager, the Director of Finance, and the Finance and
Administrative Committee have reviewed the bids and recommend that the Board of Commissioners (i)
find that each highlighted bid listed on the Exhibit, (collectively, the "Low Bids") is a lowest responsible
bid for the corresponding type of Product listed in the "ITEM" column of the Exhibit and (ii) award
contracts for the Products to Arthur Clesen, Lincolnshire, 1llinois; BTSI, New Lenox, Illinois;
Chicagoland Turf, Downers Grove, Illinois; Conserv FS, Wauconda, lllinois; Great Lakes Turf, LLC,
Byron Center, Michigan; John Deere Landscapes, Cleveland, Ohio; Pendleton Turf Supply, Waterford,
Wisconsin; Progro-Solutions, Mendota, Illinois, Reinders, Inc., Elgin, Illinois, and Winfield Solutions,
Dixon, Illinois, (collectively the “Bidders”) consistent therewith, pursuant to which the District may
purchase such amounts of the Products that it determines are necessary or desirable for District use (the
“Contracts"); and

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners hereby finds that each Low Bid is a lowest responsible bid for
the corresponding type of Product listed in the "ITEM" column of the Exhibit;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Commissioners of the Lake County Forest
Preserve District, Lake County, Illinois, THAT:

Section 1: Recitals. The recitals set forth above are incorporated as part of this Resolution by this
reference.

Section 2: Acceptance of Bids. The Low Bids in the amounts listed on the Exhibit (the “Contract
Prices”) are hereby accepted and Contracts for the Products are hereby awarded to the Bidders.

Section 3: Execution of Contract. The Executive Director of the District is hereby authorized to execute
the Contracts for the Products in the amount of the Contract Prices.




Section 4. Payments. The District Treasurer shall make payments under the Contracts only pursuant to
and in accordance with the Contracts' terms.

Section 5: Effective Date. This Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage
and approval in the manner provided by law.

PASSED this day of , 2015.
AYES:
NAYS:
APPROVED this day of , 2015.

Ann B. Maine, President
Lake County Forest Preserve District

ATTEST:

Julie Gragnani, Secretary

Exhibit No.



LAKE COUNTY FOREST PRESERVES BID # 15043
ARTHUR BTSI CHICAGOLAND [  CONSERV GREAT JOHN PENDELTON PROGRO REINDERS WINFIELD
# |ITEM SIZE CLESEN TURF FS LAKES DEERE TURF SOLUTIONS
1 [BANOL 2X2.5GAL [$ 1,850.00 $ 1,850.00 $ 1,850.00 $ 1,850.00 [ $ 1,850.00
2 |CHIPCO 26019 2X2.5GAL [$ 220.00 $ 167.60 $ 189.98  $ 241.50
3 |COMPASS 4 $ 1,475.00 $ 1,596.00 $ 143640 | $ 1,630.45 $ 1,464.68 [ $ 1,410.56
4 |DACONIL WEATHERSTICK 2X2.5GAL [$ 292.50 $ 292.50 $ 292.50 $ 292.50 | § 292.50
5 |ECHO720 2X2.5 GAL $ 121.85
6 |EMERALD 4.94 $ 145040 | § 145040 [ $ 1,20540 | § 1,249.50 $ 145040 | $ 1,450.04 [ $ 145040 | $ 145040 | $ 1,450.40
7 |HEADWAY 1 GAL $ 417.00 $ 417.00 $ 417.00 | § 417.00 $ 417.00 | § 417.00
8 |HERITAGE 1# $ 317.00 $ 317.00 $ 317.00 | § 317.00 $ 317.00 | § 317.00
9 |LEXICON 4X210Z $ 1689.24 | § 1,689.24 [ $ 1689.24 | § 1,689.24 $ 1,689.24 [ $ 1,689.24 [ $ 1,689.24 | $ 1,689.24 [ $ 1,689.24
10 [PROSTAR 124 $ 649.00 $ 695.33 $ 625.68 | $ 720.00 $ 658.74 | § 639.24
11 [QUALIPRO AZOXY 50 WDG 1# $ 250.00 $ 260.00
12 [QUALIPRO CHLORO 720 2X2.5 GAL $ 160.00 [ $ 145.00 $ 126.00 $ 119.98 [ $ 146.68
13 [QUALIPRO ENCLAVE 2X2.5GAL [$ 580.00 | § 580.00 | § 644.00 $ 580.00 | § 580.00 $ 575.00 | § 580.00
14 [QUALIPRO IPRO 2SE 2X2.5 GAL $ 220.00 $ 192.50 $ 190.00 $ 174.86
15 [QUALIPRO TEBU 3.6 F 4X1 GAL $ 232.00 | § 320.00 | § 200.00 $ 25724 1§ 245.00 $ 19764  $ 400.00
16 [QUALIPRO TM 4.5 2X2.5 GAL $ 325.00 | § 291.00 | § 296.00 $ 260.00
17 [SECURE 2X2.5GAL [$ 2,825.00 $ 2,825.00 $ 2,825.00 | § 2,825.00 $ 2,825.00 | § 2,825.00
18 |XZEMPLAR 2X1140Z [$ 3,052.92 | § 3,052.92 | § 2,907.00 | § 3,062.92 $ 3,052.92 | § 3,052.92 | § 3,052.92 | § 3,052.92 | § 3,052.92
19 [DEFENDER/DIMENSION PACK |1 PACK $ 1,090.00 $ 1,195.30 | § 849.00 $ 1,000.00 [ $ 1,227.00 $ 964.80 | § 919.10
20 |LONTREL 1QT1 $ 155.00 $ 105.00 | § 135.00 $ 130.00 [ $ 169.00 $ 152.98 [ $ 138.42
21 |QUALIPRO 2D 4X1 GAL $ 355.00 | § 327.70 | § 396.00 $ 330.00 | § 378.50
22 |QUALIPRO 3D 2X2.5 GAL $ 170.00 [ $ 96.24 | § 149.65 $ 130.00
23 |16/90 5 GAL $ 240.00 $ 250.00 | § 324.75
24 |ALYPSO 2X2.5GAL [$ 400.00 $ 1,472.00 $ 400.00
25 |DISPATCH INJECTABLE 55 GAL $ 1,710.55 $ 1,677.50 [ $ 1,677.50
26 |DUPLEX 55 GAL $ 1,009.00 | § 1,097.25 $ 1,177.00
27 |EZTABS 24CT $ 193.60 | § 196.00 $ 224.00
28 |HYDRO WET 55 GAL $ 1,691.25
29 |MAGNUS 2X2.5 GAL $ 265.84 | § 269.75 $ 314.00
30 [Tv23 2X2.5 GAL $ 76.00
31 |VIVAX 2X2.5GAL [$ 368.56 $ 368.55 | § 368.55 $ 368.55
32 |VIVAXTABS 24CT $ 285.20 $ 242.50
33 ]0-0-7 W/IACE 50# $ 24.95]8 29.00 3120 § 25.40 $ 2095|$ 27.25 25318 23.89
34 |0-0-7 W/ACE DIM 50# $ 61.67 | 8 63.64 61.67 | $ 61.67 $ 63.64 55.51 |8 61.67
35 0-0-7 W/DIM 50# $ 17.90 1433 § 12.85 $ 13.15 1456 | § 12.29
36 ]0-0-7 W/MID 50# $ 1530 | § 17.90 19401 14.80 $ 13.75 1568 | $ 16.55
37 |24-0-5 UMAXX W/ACE 50# NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
38 |24-0-5 UMAXX W/ACE 2000# NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID
39 |ANDERSONS 22-0-7 W/ACE 50# 34.35 40.20
40 |ANDERSONS 22-0-7 W/ACE 2000# 1,374.00 1,608.00
41 |ANDERSONS DG 15-0-15 40# 48.80 48.80 $ 48.80 [ § 48.80 | § 48.80
42 |ASTRON 2X2.5 GAL $ 445.00
43 |EC GROW 15-0-15 W/ACE 50# 40.20 $ 27.80 $ 40.30 | § 3745
44 |EC GROW 15-0-15 W/ACE 2000# 1,608.00 $ 1,102.00 $ 1,612.00 [ $ 1,498.00
45 |LEBANON 20-0-5 W/ACE 50# 32.80 $ 38.75
46 |LEBANON 20-0-5 W/ACE 2000# 1,312.00 $ 1,550.00
47 |PENDELTON 0-0-26 2X2.5 GAL 105.00
48 |PENDELTON 3-30-3 2X2.5 GAL 48.00
49 |PENDELTON 5% IRON 2X2.5 GAL 41.00
50 |PENDELTON 5-0-0-5FE 2X2.5 GAL 38.50
51 |PENDELTON 5-10-15-1S 2X2.5 GAL 56.00
52 |PENDELTON 6-2-3 2X2.5 GAL 75.00
53 |PENDELTON PROSTARA 2X2.5 GAL 80.00
54 |PER4 MAX 2X2.5 GAL $ 390.00
ARTHUR BTSI CHICAGOLAND |  CONSERV GREAT JOHN PENDELTON PROGRO REINDERS WINFIELD

# |ITEM SIZE CLESEN TURF FS LAKES DEERE TURF SOLUTIONS
55 |PHUSION MANGANESE 7% 2X2.5 GAL $ 46.00
56 |PLANT FOOD 6 IRON 2X2.5 GAL $ 76.00
57 |PROTESYN 2X2.5 GAL $ 250.00
58 |STRESSPHITER 0-0-30 2X2.5 GAL 100.00
59 |UMAXX 47-0-0 50# 27.65 3433($ 28.80 31.25| % 31.00
60 |UMAXX 47-0-0 2000# 1,106.00 137330 | § 1,050.00 1,249.00  § 1,180.00
61 |ACELEPRYN 0.5 GAL 927.50 927.50 | § 927.50 927.50 927.50 927.50 927.50
62 [MERIDIAN 25 WG 1702 92.00 95.63 80.59 93.00 97.50 87.89
63 [BLACK ONYX WSP 16X1CT 224.00 276.00 270.00 265.96 269.12
64 |CAPTAIN XTR ALGAECIDE 2X2.5 GAL 200.00 201.25 200.00 141.40
65 |CUTLESS MEC 2X2.5GAL [$ 1,820.00 1,820.00 1,820.00 1,820.00 $ 1,820.00 1,820.00 1,820.00 1,820.00 1,820.00
66 |LEGACY 2X2.5GAL [$ 1,900.00 1,900.00 1,900.00 1,900.00 $ 1,900.00 1,900.00 1,900.00 1,900.00 1,900.00
67 |QUALIPRO FOURSOME 4X1 GAL 525.00 475.00 500.00 450.00 419.00 593.40
68 |QUALIPRO T NEX 2X2.5GAL [$ 499.00 [ § 560.00 189.26 1,425.00 $ 514.48 575.00 571.98 725.00
69 [SECLEAR ALGAECIDE 2X2.5GAL [$ 76.00 81.70 100.00 [ $ 76.50 57.00
70 |SONAR Q ALGAECIDE 8# 422.30 | § 398.40 420.00 [ $ 369.60 315.84
71 |TRANSFILM 2X2.5 GAL 126.20 $ 150.56 179.00 $ 163.40 158.30
72 |TURFSCREEN 2X2.5 GAL 530.00 480.00 [ $ 475.00
73 _|WINTERGREEN PLUS 2X2.5 GAL 21595 § 233.75 $ 209.00




