

General Offices 1899 West Winchester Road Libertyville, Illinois 60048 847-367-6640 • Fax: 847-367-6649 www.LCFPD.org

DATE: March 1, 2021

TO: Jessica Vealitzek, Chair

Operations Committee

Agenda Item#_ /D, 3

Julie Simpson, Chair Finance Committee

FROM: James L. Anderson

Director of Natural Resources

Alex Eichman

Chief of Golf Course Operations

RECOMMENDATION: Recommend approval of a resolution awarding contracts for District-Wide Plant Protectant Chemicals to Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc., BTSI, Clesens Inc., Chicagoland Turf, Conserv FS, Growing Solutions, Inc., Pendelton Turf Supply, Reinders, Inc., SiteOne Landscape Supply, and VanDiest Supply Company in a total amount not to exceed \$342,900.00.

STRATEGIC DIRECTIONS SUPPORTED: Organizational Sustainability; Conservation

<u>FINANCIAL DATA:</u> The District's approved FY2021 budget provides for payment for these products with \$80,000.00 in the Natural Resources Grounds Maintenance Supplies and \$262,900.00 in the Golf Grounds Commodities. Specific account codes are shown on Appendix A to this memorandum.

BACKGROUND: These products are purchased annually and used on an as-needed basis to maintain the golf courses and provide the needed herbicide applications throughout the other properties in the District. Each yellow bid and each red highlighted bid listed on the Exhibit attached to the attached resolution is the lowest (or potential lowest) bid for the corresponding type of Product. The bids highlighted in blue on the Exhibit attached to the resolution do not conform to the bidding specifications because they include unacceptable alternate products, container sizes, or units of measure that would result in a purchase of excess product or otherwise do not conform to the bidding specifications. The staff recommends the rejection of the highlighted in blue.

With respect to the red highlighted bids on lines 44 and 71 of the Exhibit, the bidders have sent written requests to withdraw these bids stating that their low bids are typographical errors.

If the blue highlighted bids are rejected and the red highlighted bids are allowed to be withdrawn, then the yellow highlighted bids are the low bids for each product.

REVIEW BY OTHERS: Chief Operations Officer, Director of Finance, Manager of Landscape Ecology, Purchasing Manager and Corporate Counsel.

APPENDIX A

The Plant Protectant products for Ecological Restoration and Grounds Maintenance have been budgeted for in the Natural Resources Grounds Maintenance Supplies account code 27643800-641100.

The Plant Protectant products for Golf Operations have been budgeted for in the Revenue Facilities Golf Grounds Commodities account codes:

Countryside

80523800-642200 (herbicide)

80523800-642300 (fertilizer)

80523800-642400 (plant protectants)

80523800-642500 (insecticide)

80523800-642600 (turf grass chemicals)

Brae Loch

81523800-642200 (herbicide)

81523800-642300 (fertilizer)

81523800-642400 (plant protectants)

81523800-642500 (insecticide)

81523800-642600 (turf grass chemicals)

ThunderHawk

83523800-642200 (herbicide)

83523800-642300 (fertilizer)

83523800-642400 (plant protectants)

83523800-642500 (insecticide)

83523800-642600 (turf grass chemicals)

STATE OF ILLINOIS)
) SS
COUNTY OF LAKE)

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS LAKE COUNTY FOREST PRESERVE DISTRICT REGULAR MARCH MEETING MARCH 9, 2021

MISTER PRESIDENT AND MEMBERS OF THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS:

Your **OPERATIONS COMMITTEE** and **FINANCE COMMITTEE** present herewith "A Resolution Awarding Contracts for the Purchase of Plant Protectant Products" and requests its approval.

OPERATIONS COMMITTEE:	
Date: March 1, 2021	Roll Call Vote: Ayes: 7 Nays:
	☐ Voice Vote Majority Ayes; Nays:
	207
FINANCE COMMITTEE:	
Date: March 4,2021	Roll Call Vote: Ayes: 9 Nays:
	☐ Voice Vote Majority Ayes; Nays:

LAKE COUNTY FOREST PRESERVE DISTRICT LAKE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

A RESOLUTION AWARDING CONTRACTS FOR THE PURCHASE OF PLANT PROTECTANT PRODUCTS

WHEREAS, the Lake County Forest Preserve District (the "District") has advertised in <u>The Lake County News Sun</u> for sealed bids to purchase plant protectant products, which are listed under the column titled "PRODUCT DESCRIPTION" on the attached exhibit (the "Products"); and

WHEREAS, all sealed bids were received and opened by the District at its General Offices, 1899 West Winchester Road, Libertyville, Illinois on January 26, 2021 at 11:00 a.m.; and such bids are summarized on the exhibit attached hereto (the "Exhibit"); and

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners hereby finds that the blue highlighted bids on the Exhibit are for incorrect and unacceptable alternate products, container sizes, or units of measure that do not conform to the bidding specifications for the Products (the "Non-Conforming Bids"); and

WHEREAS, Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc., Chicagoland Turf, and Clesens, Inc., have requested that they be allowed to withdraw the red highlighted bids on the Exhibit, stating that such bids are typographical errors (the "Incorrect Bids"); and

WHEREAS, the District's staff; the Purchasing Manager; the Chief of Golf Operations, the Director of Natural Resources; the Operations Committee and the Finance Committee have reviewed the bids, and based upon the bids, recommend that the Board of Commissioners (i) allow the Incorrect Bids to be withdrawn (ii) reject the Non-Conforming Bids, (iii) find that each yellow highlighted bid listed on the Exhibit (collectively, the "Low Bids") is a lowest responsible bid for the corresponding type of Product listed in the "PRODUCT DESCRIPTION" column of the Exhibit and (iv) award contracts for the Products to each of Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc., Wheeling, Illinois; BTSI, New Lenox, Illinois; Chicagoland Turf, Downers Grove, Illinois; Clesens Inc., Lincolnshire, Illinois; Conserv FS, Wauconda, Illinois; Growing Solutions, Inc., New Lenox, Illinois; Pendelton Turf Supply, Inc., Waterford, Wisconsin; Reinders, Inc., Elgin, Illinois; SiteOne Landscape Supply, Wheeling, Illinois; and VanDiest Supply Company, Freeport, Illinois, (collectively the "Low Bidders") for the Products for which each Low Bidder submitted a Low Bid, pursuant to which the District may purchase such amounts of the Products that it determines are necessary or desirable for District use (the "Contracts"); and

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners hereby finds that each Low Bid is a lowest responsible bid for the corresponding type of Product listed in the "PRODUCT DESCRIPTION" column of the Exhibit;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Commissioners of the Lake County Forest Preserve District, Lake County, Illinois THAT:

<u>Section 1.</u> <u>Recitals</u>. The recitals set forth above are incorporated as a part of this Resolution by this reference.

<u>Section 2.</u> <u>Rejection of Non-Conforming Bids and Incorrect Bids.</u> The Incorrect Bids are hereby allowed to be withdrawn. The Non-Conforming Bids and the Incorrect Bids are hereby rejected.

<u>Section 3.</u> Acceptance of Bids. The Low Bids in the amounts listed on the Exhibit (the "Contract Prices") are hereby accepted and Contracts for the Products are hereby awarded to the Low Bidders.

<u>Section 4.</u> <u>Award of Contracts.</u> The Executive Director of the District is hereby authorized to execute the Contracts for the Products in the amount of the Contract Prices.

<u>Section 5.</u> <u>Payments</u>. The Treasurer shall make payments under the Contract only pursuant to and in accordance with the Contract terms.

Section 6. Effective Date. This Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and approval in the manner provided by law.

PASSED this ______ day of ______, 2021

AYES:				
NAYS:				
APPROVED this day o	f, 2021			
		3		
ATTEST:			Kyle, President ry Forest Preserve Dist	— trict
Julie Gragnani, Secretary Lake County Forest Preserve Distric	— t			
Exhibit	- .			

BID 21012 - BID TABULATION

Purchase & Delivery of Plant Protectant Products Project Managers: Mark Petitgoue and Dave Cassin

IF VENDOR LEAVES AN ITEM BL		-	DVANCE	D TURF		B1	BT8I CHICAGO UNITED INDUSTRES,										INC.	1	CONSERV FS GREAT LAMES TURF, LLC					GROWNO	SOLUTIONS, INC.	PEND	Y REINDERS, INC.				TE ONE LAN	DSCAPE SUPPLY	1	ST BUPPLY COMPANY			
OWNER SHALL CONSIDER THAT ITEM AS A	UNIT OF MEASURE	SIGM	_	a Substitute	bew.	-			иом Т	LTD	Same William	UOM	_			_		UGM	_	- 1700.000	11014	SAMORE ALEXA	1,500	HOM	STATE OF THE PARTY OF	_	_		LIOM	-	1	HOM	the box	Substitutes	цом	unitPrice	Substitution
		evilitie			eraldin	Unit Pric	_	Muton	endate	initike	Subvitution	andship	Unit Frice	Substantion	andster	Qualifrice.	Substitution	entitle	Victor	Substitution	and diskla	Unit Free 346	Inditivities	gradable Uni	itfrice Substitute	B UCM availa	ile UnitPro	ce Substitutio	and the	Mad Fro	e Sebutesto	· entiti	UnitPrice	Substitution	militie	UNEPrke.	Substitution
SGA CUBE ACTIVATOR SO	7/250AL		HS RS		-	Notice		\rightarrow	-			nested	40 bil	Pen & Train LCO	_	_	_		\$1739		-	_	\rightarrow	-	_	29		>40	_	-	+	-	5 63.98	Leves 20/30	tane	142.00	Brown 50 10
SARK OIL	31,25 GAL		NB.		+	No Bull		-	-	_				UNITA Pure Of most inserticide	- 1		_		\$111.75				\rightarrow	-	_	1	-		-	-	_	Care	3 61.58	IPET NOS	11'6 drion		ILR Plea Band Bark Of/virtue dy
CHOICE WEATHER ANASTER	2/2.5 GAL		9.5			No find		-	_		_		\$ 10.15					,410	MA				\rightarrow			1	1		1	1	1		1			5 29.55	
DRYPACKOYE	CASE		NE		1	No did		-	_			netel	retif	100000000000000000000000000000000000000					.NA							1 .	1	-	1	-	1	Lame	5 114.12	Lewis tracker WS	1/1/Fule	\$ 137.00	Big Foot WSA Speep Puttern to
GANLON JA	2X2.5 GAL		hs			fee fid							5 34000		Same	\$ 245.60	Diskupp 150	5ame	\$216.40									- 7	5000	51513		same	1 155.11			5 184.50	
SARION4	772.5 GAL		718			No Eur							\$ 470.70		Same	5 274.40	Trickspy 45	Same	\$149.15										SAME	\$480.3	(1)	\$2700	5 787.84	Jesus thickopy Center	tane		(henent 4)
INTENDEY	2X2.5 GAL		PH	_	_	No Sid	_		_			-	hatel		_			_	NA.	_			_	hilign 5	116.00			- 1	_		-	-	_			5 16175	
MAKAZE	2X2 5 GAL		NB		IMAE	5 600	no Finge	er Penner V-Star				242.568	\$ 64.00	Kanger Pro-					NA.		1		1			- 6	(6	- 64				Sales	5 67.44	Lesco prosecutor pro	same	\$ 62,50	Nonger Pro KEN Silyphor
MILESTONE	2X2.5 GAL		MI			No fee			MARE: S	2,084.38		20.5pl	\$ 1,78611		25 g/d	\$ 5000		Same	\$1,378.00								100	- 29							1496	5 1,500.00	- 10
NEW BALANCE	GAL		5 26	es,		No Bid						54	\$ 71.71		Same .	5 25.40		Same	5 77.11									10.74	swe	\$34.16							
POLARIS.	202.5 GAL		PUB			No flut							PO THE			\$ 100.50			5 805-55								- 1	-								5 11675	Pri .
ROUNDUF CUSTOM	112.5 GAL		5 23		1	Ny Bid		_	_			-	noted			\$ 105.00		_	5 105.53		_	_	-			-	-	-	_	5116.7			\$ 95.14			5 84.50	
SIGNAL INDICATION DIE SPEEDZONE	GAL 2X2.5 GAL		5 418	99		Avete		11111111111		2000			5 24.74			5 24.05			5 22.63			_	-	-	_	10000	The same	Dist SEZ		\$402.00			3 402.00	Costs his ber dye blue.		\$ 27.19	Torf Mark Shore
TRANSLINE	272.5 GAL		5 431		SAME	S ADIO			SAME 5	121150			5 416:00 model			5 805.00			5 861.75			_	\rightarrow	-	-	242.5 GA	26878	1043572	3460	2405.0		Mile	2 475.00		Letter	5 74450	
VM PREMIX BLEND-BBO 25% GARLON 4 ULTRA,				_	_	-	_	-	second 3	1,221.10	_				- 2011	3 43300		-	-	-			\rightarrow	-		_	-	+	+	_	+	_	_			-	
75% BARK OIL EC- DOUBLE RED DYE	EA		NE			- No Bid						no bid	no bld					114/89	\$ 25323.00							- 2	5.0	- 2	1						243.5 EAL	\$ 157,80	no
AZOXYSTROBIN SOWOG	3. N CONTAINER		No.	1476		. Nii trid	10 00	N/A			M/A	196	11(3)	H/A	Since	310.H	N/A:	Same	\$101.01	N/A			N/A:		N/A:	1 # CONTAN	ER 5175.00	0 N/A	SAME	\$111.0	N,IX			N/A	Later	5 125.15	R/A
SAYLETON FLO	2X2.5 GAL CASE			DOS N/SA		Ny Sia		N/A				2/25gal		N/A			N/A		. NA	MA			N/A		N/A			M/X		\$1,792.6			1779	N/A		\$ 7,770	N/A
DACONS ACTION	2X2.5 GAL CASE			B/A	-	No did		N/A	_			242.546		H/A			N/A	-	84				N/A	_	N/A		-	A/A	-		N/A		405	N/A	-	\$ 405.00	N/A
DACONIL WEATHERSTIK	272.5 GAL CASE 272.5 GAL CASE		88	m/A	1000	No fiel		N/A	-		M/A	20.564		W/A		\$120.00	N/A	Same	500.00	N/A	-		N/A	_	N/A		M 5510.00	N/A		\$130.00	N/A			N/A N/A	Satur	\$ 330.00	N/A N/A
FLUAZINAM 40%	EXI GAL CASE		-	00 N/A 00 N/A	_	\$ 1,700 8	-	N/A	-	_	A/A A/A		1100	N/A	Safer	\$330.00	N/A	-	\$330.00				N/A	-	N/A		THE RESERVE AND ADDRESS OF THE PERSON NAMED IN	0 N/A	-	\$1,000.0		1,000	530	N/A	Paris	> \$30.00	N/A N/A
FLUADNAM 40%	7X7.5 GAL CASE			00 H/A		31,7001			SAME &	2,170.00				N/A			N/A	me	33.10:00		SMI	2076.7			N/A			0 R/A		_		_		N/A			N/A
INDEMNIFY	17 OZ CONTAINER		NS.			Air bid				1.191.24		1/01		N/A	Sime	\$1,700.00	1,414		MA	N/A		44.0	N/A		N/A		210775	N/A		\$1,700.0		37.3 m	1700	N/A	same	\$ 1,700.00	N/A
MARTINA	2X2.5 GAL CASE			00 B/A		No Stat				10,701.00				N/A			N/A	Same	\$1,875.00				R/A		N/X	2825 GALC/	SE \$1,9500	N7 N/X			G N/A			N/A		\$ 1,175.00	N/A
PROPICONAZOLE 14.3	2X2.5 GAL CASE		5 386	A/M ed	SAME	5 250.0	00 N	N/N			N/A	Zeithe	Date	N/A			N/A	Same	5227.75	AUX	SAME	387.15	N/A		M/A	THE SERVE	nt 5000	M/K	SAME	\$225.00	N/A			H/K	same	5 210.50	N/A
RESIANT	ZYZ S GAL CASE		NE	8/4		Netle		NJA .			N/A	metid	meltid	N/A	Serve	\$94.00	N/A		8.8				N/A		N/A				_		8/8	_		N/A		\$ 31.50	NA
HOME	2X2.5 GAL CASE		NS.			Matic				4,065.60	H/K	30360		M/A			N/K	\Box	NA.	NJA			N/A		N/A		- 30	N/X				Lime		M/A			N/A
SECURE ACTION TERUCONAZOLE 3.6F	ZYZ S GAL CASE			R/A		No See			S IMM	4,264.30				N/A			R/A	1	MA		2007		M/A		N/A		4 200				n/A		3250	N/A		\$ 1,750.00	N/A
DEFENDOR	4X1 GAL CASE			00 H/A		5 218.0		N/A	-	_			240	9/8			W/A		\$276.64		SAME		N/A	-	N/A		\$ \$211:00				N/A		254.82			5 199.60	
DEFENDOR/DIMENSION PACK	1 FACK			00 N/A	+-	No Sid		N/A	_		N/A	Arles Lines		N/A N/A	Same	5735.00	N/A N/A		\$736.00 \$1,122.00		-		N/A	-	N/A N/A		-	N/A		\$1,122.0	N/A N/A	Same	1122	N/A N/A		\$ 716.00 \$ 1,122.00	M/A N/A
DIMENSION 2EW	2XZ 5 GAL CASE			M/A	_	Noted		MAN.	-	-			1077.5	N/A	Same	Syarrise.	N/A		\$1,0730		-		N/A	-	R/A		-	R/A			N/A		30723	N/A		5 1.077.10	N/A
LONTAEL	1 OT CONTAINER			N/A				N/A			N/A		165	N/A			N/A		\$149.00				N/A		N/A		-	N/A			N/A		132.39		-	-	N/A
QUAUPRO 3D	4X1 GALCASE			11/4				NJA .	SAME 5	415.42			318.24	N/A			N/A						N/A		N/A		4 51,000			SANEOR			341.08	N/A	same	5 313.60	14/4
QUALIFRO 30	2X2.5 GAL CASE		168	N/A	TAME	\$ 1100	00 M	N/A		_1000	N/A	2x25qd	114.44	N/A		254.50			\$202.75				N/A		M/A					\$45,00			-	9/A	C same	5 90.25	N/A
QUICKSILVER	AXE OF CASE			GO N/A					SAME S	378.16			648 84	N/A			N/A						N/A		N/A		\$ \$600.00	o N/A		\$67000		same	654.74	h/A	Same	5 495,60	N/A
buritx	727,5 GAL CASE			N/A		No But		N/A					118.88	N/A			NJA		500.15				R/A		N/A		-	n/A	-		N/A	-	-	M/A			14/4
OUPLEX OUPLEX	55 GAL DIEUM 275 GAL TANK			00 N/A		No Sed		N/A	_		N/K		1067.16	N/A			N/A		\$1,099.45		_		N/A		N/A			N/A	+	-	M/A	+	-	N/A		_	N/A
EZ TABS	24 CT CASE	_		N/A		No Sul		N/A N/A	_	-	N/A		4711.66 225	N/A			N/A		\$5,076.65 \$138.88		_		N/A	_	R/A M/A			N/A	+	_	R/A	+	_	R/A N/A		_	N/A N/A
HYDROWET	55 GAL DAUAN			8/4		Name		N/A	_		N/A		mbid.	R/A	5000		N/A		\$1,416.05				N/A	_	MA		_	N/A		-	M/N	-	_	8/4			N/A
PREOP	2X2.5 CASE	-		N/A		No Bud		N/A	_			212564	-10179	N/A	Same		N/A	-	NA.	N/A			N/A		N/A			ts/s		-	N/A	_	_	B/A			8/4
PRECIP	55 GAL DAUM		NE	N/A		Na Bul	N	N/A			N/A	70 Ed		N/A	Same	51,925.00	N/A		NA.	N/A			N/A		54.50.			hi/A			N/A			ts/A			N/A
TOTELNO	5 GAL CASE			8/A		No field	N	N/A			N/A:		no led	N/A			N/A		BA.	N/A			N/A		M/A		\$36150				N/A	2x2.5gs	260 N	RIA			NA
TV STS	1 GALJUG			N/A		No Bal		N,D,			N/A	146		N/A			N/A		NA.	8/8			N/A		11/A		- 1	M/A		_	N/A			MA			N/A
VIVAT	2X2.5 GAL CASE			O MA		No fiel		N/A	_		N/X		REAL	N/A			N/A		SARLAD	N/A	-		N/A	\rightarrow	M/A	-		N/A	-	_	H/A	1	-	M/A		_	N/A
D-G-7 WITH D-G-7% ACELEPRYN	SON BAG	-		N/A		No Did No Did		NJA.	-	_	N/A		221.94 29.76	M/A			N/A		\$115.00	N/A	-		N/A N/A	_	tufa.		527,40	NA.	1.000	\$16.50	M/A			M/A M/A		5 25.90	N/A N/A
LANGESTONIA NE A A SON CONTROL AND AREA			- No.	H/X	1	-		-	-	_	N/A	50%	79.76	N/A	Sine	31e so	NJA	Same	3/6/0	H/A		_	N/A	-	1/4	Scie dAG	247.All	A/A	SWIT	31850	HJX	Late	26,0	M/A	une	3 -15-90	N/A
BARRICADE	SON BAG		10	N/A		No Bid	N	N/A			M/A	560	1177	N/A	Same	SIKEL	N/A		94	M/A			N/A		N/A	1/2	175	N/A		1	N/A			14/4			NZA
ANDERSONS 15-0 0 80% FORTIFY AND 28%	1000# TOTE		50	N/A		No Bid	N	N/A			N/A	1000 %	771.4		. 1	\$101.33	N/A		NA.	N/A			N/A		N/A					1				N/A			
BARRICADE ANDERSONS FOLYEC SG 24-0-8	3X13.6# CASE	-		NJA NJA	-	Bette	_	M/A	_	-	N/A	1000 N		N/A M/A	Same		N/A N/A	+	NA.		-		N/A	_	N/A	-		N/A M/A	w	\$200.00	N/A N/A	1		N/A	une	5 201.00	M/A M/A
GOLD STANDARD 45	IXIS GAL CASE		\$ 350		1	Notes		N/A			N/A	pated		N/A	-	\$201 IA	N/A	1	BA	N/A			N/A		N/A	1		R/A	5001	30000	N/A	+		N/A		7 70100	N/A
LEBANON 16-0-8 GREENS GRADE	40# BAG		no.	A/A		5 is.o		N/A			N/A	400		MA	Sime	518.00		1	MA		_		N/A		N/A	- 5		H/A		1	N/A	time	17.5	N/A			MA
PENDELTON D-O-24 PHOSPHITE	212.5 GAL CASE			8/4		Nethit		W/A			N/A		mbid	N/A			N/A		84				N/A		N/A		\$90.00	нр			11/14			M/N			N/A
PENDELYON READY PHYTE	2X2.5 GAL CASE		10	A/A		No Stul	- 6	N/A			N/A	na bid	mi bid	N/A.			N/A		NA.				N/A		N/A						:R/A		1	N/A			N/A
PENDELTON 5-0-0-SPE	282.5 GAL CASE		NB	N/4		Noted	N	N/A			N/A	mitted	no Sid	N/A			N/A		No.	N/A			R/A		N/A	2875 646 64	M \$39.00	N/h			N/A			N/n			N/A
PENDEUTON 30-0-0 50% CRN AND AMINO	2X2 5 GAL CASE		No.	N/A		No Bld	N	N/A			N/A	nubit	manufacture.	N/A			N/A		900	1946			M/A		NA	21175 FALC	SI \$53 50	N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A
PLANT FOOD 6 MON 12-0-0	2KZ.S GAL CASE			N/4		Na Bid		kita.			N/A	nobe	_	N/A			N/A	1	NA.	M/A	-1		N/A		N/A			N/A			N/A	1		N/A			N/A
STRESSPHITER O-0-30	2X2.5 GAL EAST			B/A		No full		N/A.				202560		11/A			N/A		8.6				MJA		N/A			N/A			8,04			N/A			N/A
PRUDENT 44	IX2 5 GAL CASE		NR			Ato Rid		N/A			N/A	242 tquf		n/a			N/A		NA.	MA			нја		N/A.	1		NA	1	1	N/A			MA			N/A
TURFMARK BLUE	212.5 CASE		heb	R/A		No Bid		N/A			RJA.	242.5gal		N/A			N/A	Sine	\$215.40				N/A		N/A		\$215.00		SAME					N/A			H/A
UMAXX 46-0-0	564 BAG			11/1		Netid		K/A.			MA	SOb		16/3.		525.81	N/A		53625				M/A		N/A	1 2	-	MA		\$29.20		1		N/A		5 34.50	
UVATE 46-00	2000# TOTE	-		N/A		Nutted			SAME S	1.791.60				N/A	Some		N/A		\$999.00		\rightarrow		AL/A	_	N/A	-	-	N/A			M/A	-		N/A		\$ 860,00	
UREA 46 0 0 ACELEPRIN	504 8AG	-		y N/A	-	Natid		K/A	-		N/A			N/A		\$12.90	N/A		\$11.10		\rightarrow		N/A	_	N/A	-	-	N/A		\$15.65		14760		N/A		5 14.75	N/A
LAMBOA	0.5 GALJUG 1 GALJUG		99	N/A	_	No Sid		N/A	-	_	N/A N/A	Apl		M/A N/A	Same	almilio.	N/A N/A	Safte:	\$1,044.50				N/A N/A	_	N/A	TON HE	\$61.00	N/A	SAME	318315	N/A	satur	1031.5	N/A N/A	une	\$ 1,611.90	N/A N/A
MERIOLAN 25 WG	17 OZ CONTAINER			R/A		Noted					NUN.		530	N/A			N/A			H/A			R/A	_	N/A	34/11/10	341.00	N/A	1		N/A			N/A			N/A
CUTLESS MEC	2X2,5GAL CASE			M/A		\$15450		K/A	_			242.5gsl		N/A	Some	\$1,540.00	NJA	Spine	\$1,946.00				N/A		N/A	7935444 64	M 513410		5444	\$1546.0		120e	1941:	N/A	time	5 LINE 00	N/A
utgace	EXELS GAL CASE			a NA				N/A				212.544		R/A	Some	11,500.00	N/A	Same	\$1,968.10				N/A		N/A		4 51,333.3		TAME			1470		N/A	same	\$ 1,568,10	W/A
TRINDSAPACETHISLESS	DK2.5-GAL CASE		\$ 600.0	N/A	SAME	5 6100	0 A	N/A			AJA.			M/A	Same	\$491.00			\$495.00		SWE		N/A		N/A			N/A		\$410.00			805.33	N/A		5 - 194.40	N/A
CAPTAIN XTR	ZXZ,5-GAL CASE		5 176	10 N/IL	SAM	\$ 1110	NO N	N/A			11/14		157.4	N/A			N/A						N/A		N/A	2125 EALEA	54 5545.90	N/A	SWE	5110.00	MA	1000	214.44	N/A	Satter	\$ 186,00	N/A
HOLAN	2X2.5 GAL CASE		5 741	00 H/A	SAME	\$ 62.0	0 6	K/A			MJA.	247.5gsf	GH	N/A	Some	\$81.10	N/A	Same	\$81.05	H/A			NJA		N/A	MINORCA	M 565-00	N/A	SAME	\$75.00	H/A		64.96	N/A	une		N/A
SONAR 1	10 y BUCKET			# N/s.	SAME	5 6810	10 M	N/A			N/A			N/A	Same	\$681.00	N/A	Sine	\$653.17	N/A			N/A		N/A		\$511.00	N/A	SMI	5681.00	N/A			N/A	1.16	5 3424	8/6
WINTEAGREEN PLUS	2X2.5 GAL CASE		NO	N/A	1	No.11-d	1 N	K/A			ALTA.	202540	195.94	9/6	Same	\$300.00	N/A	Same	\$200.00	m/A		1 70	N/A		N/A			NZA:	SAME	5350.00	16/A		1	NZA .			N/A