\t? General Offices
1899 West Winchester Road

M{_ Lake County Libertyvile, linois 50043
@ Forest Preserves BT SerShi0 S a7 e

DATE: March 1, 2021

TO: Jessica Vealitzek, Chair
Operations Committee

Julie Simpson, Chair
Finance Committee

FROM: James L. Anderson
Director of Natural Resources

Alex Eichman
Chief of Golf Course Operations

RECOMMENDATION: Recommend approval of a resolution awarding contracts for District-
Wide Plant Protectant Chemicals to Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc., BTSI, Clesens Inc.,
Chicagoland Turf, Conserv FS, Growing Solutions, Inc., Pendelton Turf Supply, Reinders, Inc.,
SiteOne Landscape Supply, and VanDiest Supply Company in a total amount not to exceed
$342,900.00.

STRATEGIC DIRECTIONS SUPPORTED: Organizational Sustainability; Conservation

FINANCIAL DATA: The District’s approved FY2021 budget provides for payment for these
products with $80,000.00 in the Natural Resources Grounds Maintenance Supplies and
$262,900.00 in the Golf Grounds Commodities. Specific account codes are shown on Appendix
A to this memorandum.

BACKGROUND: These products are purchased annually and used on an as-needed basis to
maintain the golf courses and provide the needed herbicide applications throughout the other
properties in the District. Each yellow bid and each red highlighted bid listed on the Exhibit
attached to the attached resolution is the lowest (or potential lowest) bid for the corresponding type
of Product. The bids highlighted in blue on the Exhibit attached to the resolution do not conform
to the bidding specifications because they include unacceptable alternate products, container sizes,
or units of measure that would result in a purchase of excess product or otherwise do not conform
to the bidding specifications. The staff recommends the rejection of the highlighted in blue.

With respect to the red highlighted bids on lines 44 and 71 of the Exhibit, the bidders have sent
written requests to withdraw these bids stating that their low bids are typographical errors.

If the blue highlighted bids are rejected and the red highlighted bids are allowed to be withdrawn,
then the yellow highlighted bids are the low bids for each product.

REVIEW BY OTHERS: Chief Operations Officer, Director of Finance, Manager of Landscape
Ecology, Purchasing Manager and Corporate Counsel.



APPENDIX A

The Plant Protectant products for Ecological Restoration and Grounds Maintenance have been
budgeted for in the Natural Resources Grounds Maintenance Supplies account code 27643800-
641100.

The Plant Protectant products for Golf Operations have been budgeted for in the Revenue Facilities
Golf Grounds Commodities account codes:

Countryside

80523800-642200 (herbicide)
80523800-642300 (fertilizer)
80523800-642400 (plant protectants)
80523800-642500 (insecticide)
80523800-642600 (turf grass chemicals)

Brae Loch

81523800-642200 (herbicide)
81523800-642300 (fertilizer)
81523800-642400 (plant protectants)
81523800-642500 (insecticide)
81523800-642600 (turf grass chemicals)

ThunderHawk

83523800-642200 (herbicide)
83523800-642300 (fertilizer)
83523800-642400 (plant protectants)
83523800-642500 (insecticide)
83523800-642600 (turf grass chemicals)




STATE OF ILLINOIS)
) SS
COUNTY OF LAKE )

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
LAKE COUNTY FOREST PRESERVE DISTRICT
REGULAR MARCH MEETING
MARCH 9, 2021

MISTER PRESIDENT AND MEMBERS OF THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS:
Your OPERATIONS COMMITTEE and FINANCE COMMITTEE present herewith “A

Resolution Awarding Contracts for the Purchase of Plant Protectant Products” and requests its
approval.

OPERATIONS COMMITTEE:

Date: WM/;QOELI E Roll Call Vote: Ayes: 7 Nays: 0

[[] Voice Vote Majority Ayes; Nays:

FINANCE COMMITTEE:

Date: [] Roll Call Vote: Ayes: Nays:

[] Voice Vote Majority Ayes; Nays:



LAKE COUNTY FOREST PRESERVE DISTRICT
LAKE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

A RESOLUTION AWARDING CONTRACTS FOR THE
PURCHASE OF PLANT PROTECTANT PRODUCTS

WHEREAS, the Lake County Forest Preserve District (the “District”) has advertised in The Lake
County News Sun for sealed bids to purchase plant protectant products, which are listed under the
column titled “PRODUCT DESCRIPTION” on the attached exhibit (the “Products”); and

WHEREAS, all sealed bids were received and opened by the District at its General Offices, 1899
West Winchester Road, Libertyville, Illinois on January 26, 2021 at 11:00 a.m.; and such bids are
summarized on the exhibit attached hereto (the “Exhibit”); and

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners hereby finds that the blue highlighted bids on the
Exhibit are for incorrect and unacceptable alternate products, container sizes, or units of measure
that do not conform to the bidding specifications for the Products (the “Non-Conforming Bids”);
and

WHEREAS, Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc., Chicagoland Turf, and Clesens, Inc., have requested
that they be allowed to withdraw the red highlighted bids on the Exhibit, stating that such bids are
typographical errors (the “Incorrect Bids™); and

WHEREAS, the District’s staff; the Purchasing Manager; the Chief of Golf Operations, the
Director of Natural Resources; the Operations Committee and the Finance Committee have
reviewed the bids, and based upon the bids, recommend that the Board of Commissioners (i) allow
the Incorrect Bids to be withdrawn (ii) reject the Non-Conforming Bids, (iii) find that each yellow
highlighted bid listed on the Exhibit (collectively, the “Low Bids”) is a lowest responsible bid for
the corresponding type of Product listed in the “PRODUCT DESCRIPTION” column of the
Exhibit and (iv) award contracts for the Products to each of Advanced Turf Solutions, Inc.,
Wheeling, Illinois; BTSI, New Lenox, Illinois; Chicagoland Turf, Downers Grove, Illinois;
Clesens Inc., Lincolnshire, Illinois; Conserv FS, Wauconda, Illinois; Growing Solutions, Inc., New
Lenox, lllinois; Pendelton Turf Supply, Inc., Waterford, Wisconsin; Reinders, Inc., Elgin, Illinois;
SiteOne Landscape Supply, Wheeling, Illinois; and VanDiest Supply Company, Freeport, Illinois,
(collectively the “Low Bidders™) for the Products for which each Low Bidder submitted a Low
Bid, pursuant to which the District may purchase such amounts of the Products that it determines
are necessary or desirable for District use (the “Contracts™); and

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners hereby finds that each Low Bid is a lowest responsible
bid for the corresponding type of Product listed in the “PRODUCT DESCRIPTION” column of
the Exhibit;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Commissioners of the Lake
County Forest Preserve District, Lake County, Illinois THAT:

Section 1. Recitals. The recitals set forth above are incorpofated as a part of this Resolution
by this reference.




Section 2. Rejection of Non-Conforming Bids and Incerrect Bids. The Incorrect Bids are
hereby allowed to be withdrawn. The Non-Conforming Bids and the Incorrect Bids are hereby
rejected.

Section 3. Acceptance of Bids. The Low Bids in the amounts listed on the Exhibit (the “Contract
Prices™) are hereby accepted and Contracts for the Products are hereby awarded to the Low
Bidders.

Section 4. Award of Contracts. The Executive Director of the District is hereby authorized to
execute the Contracts for the Products in the amount of the Contract Prices.

Section 5. Payments. The Treasurer shall make payments under the Contract only pursuant to
and in accordance with the Contract terms.

Section 6. Effective Date. This Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its
passage and approval in the manner provided by law.

PASSED this day of , 2021
AYES:
NAYS:
APPROVED this day of , 2021
ATTEST: Angelo D. Kyle, President

Lake County Forest Preserve District

Julie Gragnani, Secretary
Lake County Forest Preserve District

Exhibit




EXHIBIT

BID 21012 - BID TABULATION
Purchase & Delivery of Plant Protectant Products

Project Managers: Mark Petitgoue and Dave Cassin

Low Bid

Substitute product or size does not conform; not accepted, reject item

Incorrect price provided; reject item

21012 Schedule of Prices - BID TABULATION - FINAL

IF VENDOR LEAVES AN ITEM BLANK,

CHICAGO UNITED INDUSTRIES,

OWNER SHALL CONSIDER THAT ITEM AS A “NO BID” ITEM. ADVANCED TURF BTSI LD CHICAGOLAND TURF CLESENS INC. CONSERV FS GREAT LAKES TURF, LLC GROWING SOLUTIONS, INC. PENDELTON TURF SUPPLY REINDERS, INC. SITE ONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY VAN DIEST SUPPLY COMPANY

ITEM # |PRODUCT DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE aviﬁ:s‘e Unit Price | Substitution avifl):sle Unit Price Substitution aviﬁ:s‘e Unit Price | Substitution aviﬁ:s‘e Unit Price Substitution aviﬁ:s‘e Unit Price | Substitution aviﬁ:s‘e Unit Price | Substitution avifl):sle Unit Price | Substitution aviﬁ:s‘e Unit Price | Substitution [ UOM available | UnitPrice | Substitution avifl):sle Unit Price | Substitution avifl):sle Unit Price Substitution avifl):sle Unit Price Substitution

1 5GA CUBE EA NB No Bid no bid no bid Same $12.99 - - -

2 |ACTIVATOR 90 2X2.5 GAL NB No Bid lgal | $ 2747 Pen A Trate ECO NA - - - same | $ 6198 Lesco 90/10 Same $42.00 Brewer 90-10

3 [BARKOIL 11.25 GAL NB No Bid 2x2.5gal ||§ 12919 | Ultra Pure Oil Hort Insecticide Same | $133.75 - - - 12 G drum $119.40 | JLB Plus Basal Bark Oil/wBlue dye added

4 CHOICE WEATHER MASTER 2X2.5 GAL NB No Bid 1gal S 30.35 LV by Precision Labs NA - Same S 29.55 Corn Belt Guardian Plus

5 |DRYPACK DYE CASE NB No Bid no bid no bid NA - - - same | $ 114.19 Lesco tracker WS 50/Pale | 127.90 Big Foot WSB Spray Pattern Indicator

6  |GARLON 3A 2X2.5 GAL NB No Bid 2x2.5gal | $ 28000 Same | $ 24560 | Triclopyr3sL2 | Same | $256.40 - SAME | $35220 same | $ 355.32 same | $ 18650 Element 3A

7 |GARLON 4 2X2.5 GAL NB No Bid 2x2.5gal | $ 47070 Same | $ 274.40 | Triclopyr4E | Same | $349.15 - - - SAME | $480.34 same | $ 282.84 | Lescotriclopyr 4 ester same | $ 21775 Element 4E

8 INTENSITY 2X2.5 GAL NB No Bid no bid no bid NA 2x2.5gcs | $ 116.00 - - - same $ 16375 Volunteer 2Ib/G Clethodim

9 |MAKAZE 2X2.5 GAL NB SAME | $ 80.00 Ra”ﬁg‘i’;: or 25gal | §  64.00 Ranger Pro NA - - - same | $ 67.44 | Lesco prosecutor pro same | $ 6250 Ranger Pro 41% Glyphosate

10 [MILESTONE 2X2.5 GAL NB No Bid SAME | $  2,084.38 2x2.5gal | $ 1,736.11 25gal | $ 843.40 Same | $1,728.00 - - - same | $ 1,500.00 no

11 |NEW BALANCE GAL $ 2645 No Bid Gal S 2376 Same | $ 2640 Same | § 2318 - SAME $34.16

12 [POLARIS 2X2.5 GAL NB No Bid no bid no bid Same | $ 30250 Same | $  305.55 - - - same | S 22475 no

13 |ROUNDUP CUSTOM 2X2.5 GAL S 9950 No Bid no bid no bid Same | $ 105.00 Same | $ 10555 - SAME | $116.76 same | $ 95.14 same | $ 8450 no

14 [SIGNAL INDICATION DYE GAL S 2505 No Bid Gal S 2474 Same | $ 2445 Same | S 22.69 - - - SAME $27.00 2x2.5gal | $  79.00 | Lesco tracker dye blue same | S 2239 Turf Mark Blue

15  |SPEEDZONE 2X2.5 GAL $ 41800 SAME | $ 402.00 | SpeedzoneEW [ SAME | $  520.94 2x2.5gal | $  416.00 Same | $ 402.00 Same | $  402.00 2x2.5 GAL $265.00 Triad SFZ SAME | $402.00 same | $ 402.00 same | $ 34675 no

16 [TRANSLINE 2X2.5 GAL NB No Bid SAME | $ 121350 no bid no bid Same | $ 895.00 Same | $ 86175 - - - same | S 746.50 no

17 |VM PREMIX BLEND-BBO 25% GARLON 4 ULTRA, A e NoBid nobid o bid 12x5gal | $ 2,172.00 . 2X25GAL | §  157.80 no

75% BARK OIL EC- DOUBLE RED DYE

18  |AZOXYSTROBIN 50WDG 1# CONTAINER NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 1lb 13333 N/A Same | $147.38 N/A same | $12333 N/A N/A N/A 1#CONTAINER | $125.00 N/A SAME | $111.00 N/A N/A same | § 12515 N/A

19 [BAYLETON FLO 2X2.5 GAL CASE $ 2,770.00 N/A No Bid N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 2770 N/A Same | $2,770.00 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $2,770.00 N/A same 2770 N/A same | $ 2,770 N/A

20  |DACONILACTION 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 405 N/A Same | $405.00 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $405.00 N/A same 405 N/A same | $  405.00 N/A

21 |DACONIL WEATHERSTIK 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 320 N/A Same | $320.00 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $320.00 N/A same 320 N/A Same | $  320.00 N/A

22 ENCLAVE 2X2.5 GAL CASE $  530.00 N/A SAME $ 530.00 N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 530 N/A Same $530.00 N/A Same $530.00 N/A N/A N/A 2X2.5 GAL CASE $530.00 N/A SAME $530.00 N/A same 530 N/A Same $  530.00 N/A

23 |FLUAZINAM 40% 4X1 GAL CASE $ 1,420.00 N/A SAME | $1,700.00 N/A N/A 4x1gal 1200 N/A N/A 2xlgal | $520.00 N/A N/A N/A 4X1GALCASE | $1,280.00 N/A SAME | $1,060.00 N/A N/A N/A

24 |FLUAZINAM 40% 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A N/A SAME | §  2,320.00 N/A no bid no bid N/A N/A NA N/A SAME | 2076.7 N/A N/A 2X2.5 GAL CASE | $1,825.00 N/A 15 gal cs | $1,325.00 N/A N/A N/A

25 |INDEMNIFY 17 0Z CONTAINER NB N/A No Bid N/A SAME | $  2,191.24 N/A 170z 1700 N/A Same | $1,700.00 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $1,700.00 N/A 1710z 1700 N/A same | $ 1,700.00 N/A

26 |MAXTIMA 2X2.5 GAL CASE $ 3,875.00 N/A No Bid N/A SAME | $ 10,700.00 N/A 2x2.5gal 3875 N/A N/A Same | $3,875.00 N/A N/A N/A 2X2.5 GAL CASE | $3,950.00 N/A SAME | $3,950.00 N/A same 3875 N/A same | $ 3,875.00 N/A

27 |PROPICONAZOLE 14.3 2X2.5 GAL CASE S 286.09 N/A SAME | $ 230.00 N/A N/A 2gal jug 122.2 N/A N/A same | $227.75 N/A SAME | 282.15 N/A N/A 2X2.5 GAL CASE $232 N/A SAME | $225.00 N/A N/A same | $ 21050 N/A

28 |RELIANT 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A no bid no bid N/A Same $94.00 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $123.08 N/A N/A same | $ 8150 N/A

29 |SECURE 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A SAME | $  4,066.60 N/A 2x2.5gal 3085 N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $3,085.00 N/A same 3085 N/A N/A

30  |SECURE ACTION 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A SAME | §  4,284.10 N/A 2x2.5gal 3250 N/A same | $3,250.00 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $3,250.00 N/A same 3250 N/A same | $ 3,250.00 N/A

31 |TEBUCONAZOLE 3.6F 4X1 GAL CASE S 325.00 N/A SAME | $ 218.00 N/A N/A 4x1gal 240 N/A Same | $231.50 N/A Same | $276.64 N/A SAME 285 N/A N/A AX1GALCASE | $212.00 N/A SAME | $220.00 N/A same | 256.82 N/A same | $ 19940 N/A

32 |DEFENDOR 4X1 QT CASE S 736.00 N/A No Bid N/A N/A 4xlat 736 N/A same | $736.00 N/A same | $736.00 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $736.00 N/A same 736 N/A same | S 736.00 N/A

33 |DEFENDOR/DIMENSION PACK 1 PACK $ 1,122.00 N/A No Bid N/A N/A 1 pack 1122 N/A N/A Same | $1,122.00 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $1,122.00 N/A same 1122 N/A same | $ 1,122.00 N/A

34 |DIMENSION 2EW 2X2.5 GAL CASE $ 1,077.50 N/A No Bid N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 1077.5 N/A same | $1,077.50 N/A same | $1,077.50 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $1,077.50 N/A same 1077.5 N/A same | $ 1,077.50 N/A

35  |LONTREL 1.QT CONTAINER S 15875 N/A SAME | $ 146.00 N/A N/A 1qt 165 N/A Same | $155.00 N/A Same | $169.00 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $185.63 N/A same 152.19 N/A N/A

36 |QUALIPRO 2D 4X1 GAL CASE NB N/A SAME | $ 360.00 N/A SAME | $ 42547 N/A 4x1gal 318.24 N/A Same | $297.50 N/A Same | $346.28 N/A N/A N/A 4X1GALCASE | $320.00 N/A SAME | $328.00 N/A same | 341.08 N/A same | $ 28260 N/A

37 QUALIPRO 3D 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A SAME | $ 130.00 N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 114.44 N/A Same $94.50 N/A Same $202.75 N/A N/A N/A 2X2.5 GAL CASE | $108.90 N/A SAME $95.00 N/A N/A same S 90.25 N/A

38 |QUICKSILVER 4X8 OZ CASE S 63060 N/A SAME | $ 700.00 N/A SAME | $ 87816 N/A 4x80z 640.84 N/A Same | $625.40 N/A same | $662.20 N/A N/A N/A 4X8 OZ CASE $600.00 N/A SAME | $670.00 N/A same | 656.28 N/A same | $ 49560 N/A

39 |DUPLEX 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 118.88 N/A Same | $119.40 N/A Same | $123.25 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

40  |DUPLEX 55 GAL DRUM $ 1,298.00 N/A No Bid N/A N/A 55 gal 1087.16 N/A Same | $1,088.00 N/A Same | $1,099.45 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

41 [DUPLEX 275 GAL TANK NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 275gal 4711.66 N/A Same | $4,778.00 N/A Same | $5076.55 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

42 |EZTABS 24 CT CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 24ct 225 N/A Same | $220.80 N/A same | $198.88 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

43 |HYDROWET 55 GAL DRUM NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A no bid no bid N/A N/A Same | $1,436.05 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

44 |PRECIP 2X2.5 CASE N/A No Bid N/A N/A 2x2.5gal N/A Same | $183.76 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

45 |PRECIP 55 GAL DRUM NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 20 gal 868.8 N/A Same | $1,925.00 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

46 SIXTEEN 90 5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A no bid no bid N/A Same $249.50 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A 5 GAL CASE $362.50 N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 260 N/A N/A

47 |TVSTS 1GALJUG NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 1gal 50 N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

48 VIVAX 2X2.5 GAL CASE $ 38340 N/A No Bid N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 3834 N/A Same $383.40 N/A Same $383.40 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

49 |VIVAX TABS 24 CT CASE $ 26100 N/A No Bid N/A N/A 24ct 221.94 N/A Same | $212.00 N/A Same | $215.00 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

50  |0-0-7 WITH 0.067% ACELEPRYN 50# BAG NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 50lb 29.76 N/A Same $26.80 N/A Same $26.35 N/A N/A N/A 50# BAG $27.40 N/A SAME $28.50 N/A same 24.43 N/A same | $ 2590 N/A

o1 ::RDRE\E%I\ES 10 0O FORTIRIAND 2E S04 BAG NB N/A NoBid N/A N/A 50lb 13.72 N/A Same $14.61 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - N/A N/A N/A N/A

2 ::RDRE\E%I\ES 10 0O FORTIRIAND 2E 10004 TOTE NB N/A NoBid N/A N/A 1000 Ib 274.4. N/A Same | $30333 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

53 |ANDERSONS FOLTEC SG 24-0-8 3X13.6# CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 3x13.6lb 209 N/A Same | $209.00 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $209.00 N/A N/A same | $  209.00 N/A

54 GOLD STANDARD 45 2X2.5 GAL CASE $  350.00 N/A No Bid N/A N/A no bid no bid N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

55 LEBANON 16-0-8 GREENS GRADE 40# BAG NB N/A SAME | $  38.00 N/A N/A 40lb 37.5 N/A Same $38.00 N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A same 375 N/A N/A

56 PENDELTON 0-0-26 PHOSPHITE 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A no bid no bid N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A 2X2.5 GAL CASE $90.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

57 PENDELTON READY PHYTE 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A no bid no bid N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A 2X2.5 GAL CASE |  $180.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

58 PENDELTON 5-0-0-5FE 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A no bid no bid N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A 2X2.5 GAL CASE $39.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

-0-0 50%

59 /F:EI\VDDSELTON O OSOR R ATDAING 2X2.5 GALCASE NB N/A NoBid N/A N/A no bid no bid N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A 2X25 GALCASE | $53.50 N/A N/A N/A N/A

60 PLANT FOOD 6 IRON 12-0-0 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A no bid no bid N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

61 STRESSPHITER 0-0-30 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 111.55 N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

62 PRUDENT 44 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 325 N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

63 | TURFMARK BLUE 2X2.5 CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 2255 N/A N/A same | $215.40 N/A N/A N/A 2X2.5 CASE $225.00 N/A SAME | $225.00 N/A N/A N/A

64 |UMAXX 46-0-0 50# BAG NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 50lb 3029 N/A Same $25.83 N/A Same $26.25 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME $28.20 N/A N/A same | $ 2450 N/A

65 |UMAXX 46-0-0 2000# TOTE NB N/A No Bid N/A SAME | §  1,281.60 N/A 2000lb 1211.6 N/A Same | $980.00 N/A same | $999.00 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $1,070.00 N/A N/A same | S 980.00 N/A

66  |UREA 46-0-0 50# BAG S 1379 N/A No Bid N/A N/A 50lb 18.7 N/A Same $12.90 N/A Same $13.10 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME $15.85 N/A same 1531 N/A same | $ 1475 N/A

67  |ACELEPRYN 0.5 GALJUG NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A Sgal 10315 N/A same | $1,031.50 N/A Same | $1,044.50 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $1,031.50 N/A same 10315 N/A same | $ 1,031.50 N/A

68  |LAMBDA 1GALJUG NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 1gal 64.44 N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A 1GALIUG $63.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

69 MERIDIAN 25 WG 17 OZ CONTAINER NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 1020z jug. 510 N/A N/A NA N/A N/A N/A - - N/A N/A N/A N/A

70 |CUTLESS MEC 2X2.5 GAL CASE $ 1,946.00 N/A SAME | $1,946.00 N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 1946 N/A Same | $1,946.00 N/A Same | $1,946.00 N/A N/A N/A 2X2.5 GALCASE | $1,946.00 N/A SAME | $1,946.00 N/A same 1946 N/A same | $ 1,946.00 N/A

71 LEGACY 2X2.5 GAL CASE $ 1,988.10 N/A SAME | $1,988.10 N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 1988.1 N/A Same N/A Same $1,988.10 N/A N/A N/A 2X2.5 GAL CASE | $1,988.10 N/A SAME $1,988.10 N/A same 1988.1 N/A same $ 1,988.10 N/A

72 |TRINEXAPAC ETHYL 11.3% 2X2.5 GAL CASE S 600.00 N/A SAME | $ 620.00 N/A N/A 1gal 125.81 N/A Same | $491.00 N/A Same | $495.00 N/A SAME | 655.5 N/A N/A 2X2.5 GALCASE |  $505.00 N/A SAME | $460.00 N/A same | 60532 N/A 2x1GAL |8 194.40 N/A

73 |CAPTAIN XTR 2X2.5 GAL CASE S 176.00 N/A SAME | $ 139.00 N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 157.4 N/A Same | $170.75 N/A same | $184.25 N/A N/A N/A 2X2.5 GALCASE | $145.90 N/A SAME | $180.00 N/A same 158.46 N/A same | $  146.00 N/A

74 SECLEAR 2X2.5 GAL CASE S 74.00 N/A SAME | $  67.00 N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 63.84 N/A Same $83.10 N/A Same $84.95 N/A N/A N/A 2X2.5 GAL CASE $65.00 N/A SAME $75.00 N/A same 64.86 N/A same S 63.75 N/A

75  |SONAR1 20 # BUCKET S 939.84 N/A SAME | $ 681.00 N/A N/A 201b 681 N/A Same | $681.00 N/A same | $651.17 N/A N/A N/A 20 # BUCKET $681.00 N/A SAME | $681.00 N/A N/A 11b S 3620 N/A

76 |WINTERGREEN PLUS 2X2.5 GAL CASE NB N/A No Bid N/A N/A 2x2.5gal 195.94 N/A Same | $205.00 N/A Same | $200.00 N/A N/A N/A - - N/A SAME | $250.00 N/A N/A N/A

Low Bid

Substitute product or size does not conform; not accepted, reject item
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